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2024 Travel Itinerary 
 

Golden Rewards Trips Scheduled for 2024 – more trips will be coming soon! 
• April 25 – The Beach Boys Ultimate Tribute Show – Take a ride with us back to the ‘60s as we head to Castleton 

Windham, NH, to experience The Beach Boys tribute band, Still Surfin. Performing the greatest hits of The Beach Boys 
for over 20 years, their performances are as true to form as the originals in concert, featuring the incredible five-part 
harmonies of The Beach Boys. 

• April 29 – May 3 – The Outer Banks, North Carolina – This thin strip of barrier islands is 200 miles long and juts out 
into the Gulf Stream of the Atlantic Ocean, bringing temperate climates and sea life to the region.  This trip will stop 
along the way to visit  Cape Hatteras, Roanoke Island Festival Park, the Graveyard of the Atlantic, Wright Brothers 
National Memorial, Elizabethan Gardens, Bodie Island Lighthouse, and Chicamacomico Life-Saving Station.  Join us for 
this fun trip.   

• May 20 – 24 – Finger Lakes, New York– Join us for fine wine and dining in the Finger Lakes. This 4-day trip includes 
visits to Sonnenberg Gardens and Mansion State Historic Park, Belhurst Castle, Finger Lakes Gaming and Racetrack, 
cruise on Seneca Lake, and more! 

• July 11 – Funny Girl at the Maine State Music Theatre – Join us as we take the Amtrak Downeaster Train to see the 
musical Funny Girl.  Sit back and relax onboard the Downeaster as we travel to the Pickard Theatre in Brunswick.  Walk 
across the street and enjoy a sandwich and salad luncheon at the Brunswick Hotel.  The theater is a short walk from 
there.  After the show, you will have a little time to enjoy downtown Brunswick or the Bowdoin College Museum of Art 
which is free of charge.   

• July 14 – 19 – Montreal & Quebec City & Canada’s Capital City, Ottawa – Travel with us to three cities in Canada 
full of history and excitement. Motorcoach transportation with 5 nights lodging in Canada including 10 meals, 5 
breakfasts and 5 dinners along with a local guide each day in Canada. Guided tours of Montréal, Québec City & 
Canada's Capital City, Ottawa. Visit Notre Dame Basilica, Montréal's Underground City and Ottawa's Parliament Hill, 
enjoy a narrated cruise on the stunning St. Lawrence River, and more.  

• July 16 – The Ultimate Jimmy Buffett Tribute – Ready to kick back with some Jimmy Buffett tunes while you crack 
open a lobster? This summer, Jimmy and the Parrots, the most requested Jimmy Buffett tribute band in the country, will 
perform for you at Fosters Clambakes in York as you chow down on a whole lobster. Come with us for a night of 
celebrating the great Jimmy Buffett! 

• August 9 – An American in Paris Musical – We are heading to Reagle Music Theatre in Waltham, MA, to be 
captivated by the musical An American in Paris. Inspired by the classic Gene Kelly film, this romantic story is centered 
around a young American soldier and a beautiful French girl in Paris. We’ll follow the journey of these two young artists 
as they explore the joys and hardships of creating art and falling in love. 

• August 13 - 22– Irish Gold Tour – Join us for this Ireland tour which explores the most acclaimed sights in the south 
and west of Ireland, including the mountainous beauty of Connemara. This tour will take in the sights of Dublin, Galway, 
the Cliffs of Moher, Killarney, Waterford, and more.  
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• October 21 – 25 – Riding the Rails in West Virginia – Spend five days and four nights exploring the wild and beautiful 
West Virginia. You’ll visit Blackwater Falls State Park, climb aboard the Cass Scenic Railroad, and be dazzled by the 
historical stones of the Smoke Hole Caverns. During the trip, you’ll also gaze at unique views of the Appalachians while 
in the comfort of a train. 

• November 3 – 9 – Pigeon Forge and Smoky Mountains Shows – Tell your “9 to 5” that you’re taking time off to visit 
the Great Smoky Mountains and Dollywood in Pigeon Forge, Tennessee! You’ll also receive VIP treatment at Paula 
Deen’s Lumberjack Feud, be captivated by the new variety show Array, be entertained by Country Tonite, and more. 
Transportation, lodging, six breakfasts, and four dinners included. 

 
 

2025 – In the works ... 
 
• May 13 - 28 – Cruise Italy, Montenegro and Croatia with 2 Nights in Rome – On this fabulous vacation, you will 

spend two nights in Rome before you board the beautiful Celebrity Constellation for your 10-night Italy/Croatia cruise.  
This vacation is one you will be talking about for years to come!   

• August 5 - 22 – Canadian Rockies and Alaskan Cruise – Travel across British Columbia by bus and train, and then 
jump on an Alaskan cruise. Create a lifetime of memories in Calgary, Jasper, Vancouver, Seward, Juneau, and more on 
this unforgettable trip. 

• October 26 – November 5 – Legendary Danube River Cruise, Prague to Budapest – Join us for two nights in Prague 
and a seven-night cruise from Nuremberg to Budapest.  Tour includes two nights in Prague with breakfast daily, all 
transfers in Europe, all hotel taxes, seven night cruise with shore excursions in each city, all meals on the ship, beer 
and wine included at lunch and dinner, shipboard gratuities, free internet on board ship, onboard entertainment and 
lectures, all taxes, fees and port charges, and travel protection.  A river cruise vacation is the most popular vacation 
today and ships sell out quickly.    
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